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From the 1980s onwards, the global wave of 
privatisation of social assets – such as health, 
education, running water, electricity, postal 
and telecommunications services and social 
security – was only the most visible manifes-
tation of the priority given to the commod-
ification of collective life. The State itself, 
together with civil society, began to be man-
aged and evaluated according to market log-
ic and return on capital criteria. The growing 
promiscuity between economic and political 
power reconfigured the State’s practices and 
policies, and hence citizens’ perception of the 
State. Despite the marked differences among 
countries, it was possible to notice some tran-
sitions from one period to the next: from wel-
fare State to ill-fare State, from protective 
State to repressive State, from regulation of 
the economy by the State to regulation of the 
State by the economy. These transitions oc-
curred at the same time as liberal democracy 
was promoted as the only internationally le-
gitimate political regime. The new coronavirus 
pandemic clearly highlighted two dissonant 
realities. On the one hand, States were called 
upon to protect citizens from the health, so-
cial and economic consequences of the pan-
demic. This was not the citizens’ choice, it was 
the only recourse open to them. On the other 
hand, when the pandemic broke out, in ear-
ly 2020, most States were completely unpre-
pared to address it and protect their citizens.

The growing tension, and even incompatibili-
ty, between the needs of capital accumulation 
and a political regime that tends to be dom-
inated by the opinion of the majority caused 
democracy to suffer successive distortions, 
leading to what I have called low-intensity 
democracies. The pandemic dramatically am-
plified two major imperatives. The first, and 
more pressing, imperative is to change the 
economic and political logic underlying public 
policies (health, education, pensions, workers’ 
rights, infrastructure). These are not costs, 
but investments in the well-being of popula-
tions that will be increasingly hit by extreme 
events. The second, a medium-term imper-
ative, is to reform the political system in or-
der to complement representative democracy 
with participatory democracy. The increasing 
incompatibility between the needs of accumu-
lation and majority governments is distorting 
and hijacking representative democracy. This 
can only be overcome through anti-capitalist, 
anti-racist and anti-sexist policies supported 
by citizens politically organised into forms of 
participatory democracy, in autonomous com-
plementarity with political parties and repre-
sentative democracy. In time, these should 
turn into movement-parties with citizen con-
trol over party oligarchies.
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